Daniel Church

From: Lawrence Anderson <Lawrence@AndersonLaw.nz>
Sent: Friday, 11 October 2024 8:56 am

To: Daniel Church; ‘Nathan Corrigan’

Cc: Catherine Stewart; Jin Park

Subject: RE: Costs Award Owed To Nathan Corrigan

Daniel stop emailing me and ordering me what to do you wanker.

Regards,

Lawrence Anderson
0276 529 529
AndersonLaw.nz

From: Daniel Church <Daniel@catherinestewart.co.nz>

Sent: Friday, 11 October 2024 8:39 am

To: Nathan Corrigan <nathancorrigan9 @gmail.com>

Cc: Lawrence Anderson <Lawrence@andersonlaw.nz>; Catherine Stewart <catherine@catherinestewart.co.nz>; Jin
Park <jin@catherinestewart.co.nz>

Subject: RE: Costs Award Owed To Nathan Corrigan

Thanks Nathan.

Lawrence — please ensure that your client makes immediate payment today. He is not above the law.
Nga mihi | Kind regards

Daniel Church BA LLB (Hons)

Senior Staff Barrister

Hobson Towers West

Level 3, 26 Hobson Street
Auckland City 1010

EMPLOYMENT LAW SPECIALIST

www.catherinestewart.co.nz

This email message and any attachments contain information that is confidential and may be legally privileged. If you are not
the intended recipient any use, disclosure or copying of this message or attachments is strictly prohibited. If you have received
this email message in error, please notify immediately and erase all copies of the message and attachments. Thank you.

From: Nathan Corrigan <nathancorrigan9 @gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 10 October 2024 5:38 pm

To: Daniel Church <Daniel@catherinestewart.co.nz>

Cc: Lawrence Anderson <Lawrence@andersonlaw.nz>; Catherine Stewart
<catherine@catherinestewart.co.nz>; Jin Park <jin@catherinestewart.co.nz>
Subject: Re: Costs Award Owed To Nathan Corrigan

| have not received no payment



On Thu, 10 Oct 2024, 3:58 pm Daniel Church, <Daniel@catherinestewart.co.nz> wrote:

Afternoon Lawrence

Please confirm if your client, Mr Menzies, has paid the $4,571.55 costs award owed to our client,
which was due for payment on 1 October.

We note that no stay has been granted by the Court, and that an application for a stay does not, in
and of itself, operate as a stay.

If you need confirmation of our client’s bank details, please let me know.

Nga mihi | Kind regards

Daniel Church BA LLB (Hons)

Senior Staff Barrister

Hobson Towers West

Level 3, 26 Hobson Street

Auckland City 1010

www.catherinestewart.co.nz

This email message and any attachments contain information that is confidential and may be legally privileged. If you are
not the intended recipient any use, disclosure or copying of this message or attachments is strictly prohibited. If you
have received this email message in error, please notify immediately and erase all copies of the message and
attachments. Thank you.





